
	
		
		
		
			
				
					
					
    



					
		
				
					

					Home
				
			
	
				
					

					Random
				
			


		
				
					

					Log in
				
			


		
				
					

					Settings
				
			


		
				
					

					Donate
				
			


		
				
					
					About Wikisource
				
			
	
				
					
					Disclaimers
				
			





					
				
				
					
						[image: Wikisource]


						
					
				

					
				
					
					
				

				
	    
Search
	


		
					
				
			

		
		
			
			

			

			
			
				
					Page:Constitution of India (9 Sep 2020).pdf/83

					

				

						
								Previous page
							
	
								Next page
							
	
								Page
							
	
								Discussion
							
	
								Image
							
	
								Index
							


				
		
				
				    
Language
				
		
	
				
				    
Watch
				
		
	
				
				    
Edit
				
		




				

			

			
				This page has been proofread, but needs to be validated.
[1][Provided that in relation to the [2][Legislatures of the States of Himachal Pradesh, Manipur, Meghalaya and Tripura] this clause shall have effect as if for the words “fifteen years” occurring therein, the words “twenty-five years” were substituted:]


	[3][Provided further that in relation to the [4][Legislatures of the States of [5][Arunachal Pradesh, Goa and Mizoram]], this clause shall have effect as if for the words "fifteen years" occurring therein, the words "forty years" were substituted.]

211. Restriction on discussion in the Legislature.—No discussion shall take place in the Legislature of a State with respect to the conduct of any Judge of the Supreme Court or of a High Court in the discharge of his duties.

212. Courts not to inquire into proceedings of the Legislature.—(1) The validity of any proceedings in the Legislature of a State shall not be called in question on the ground of any alleged irregularity of procedure.


	(2) No officer or member of the Legislature of a State in whom powers are vested by or under this Constitution for regulating procedure or the conduct of business, or for maintaining order, in the Legislature shall be subject to the jurisdiction of any court in respect of the exercise by him of those powers.


CHAPTER IV.—LEGISLATIVE POWER OF THE GOVERNOR




213. Power of Governor to promulgate Ordinances during recess of Legislature.—(1) If at any time, except when the Legislative Assembly of a State is in session, or where there is a Legislative Council in a State, except when both Houses of the Legislature are in session, the Governor is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate action, he may promulgate such Ordinances as the circumstances appear to him to require:


	Provided that the Governor shall not, without instructions from the President, promulgate any such Ordinance if—
	(a) a Bill containing the same provisions would under this Constitution have required the previous sanction of the President for the introduction thereof into the Legislature; or
	(b) he would have deemed it necessary to reserve a Bill containing the same provisions for the consideration of the President; or
	(c) an Act of the Legislature of the State containing the same provisions would under this Constitution have been invalid unless, having been reserved for the consideration of the President, it had received the assent of the President.



	(2) An Ordinance promulgated under this article shall have the same force and effect as an Act of the Legislature of the State assented to by the Governor, but every such Ordinance—
	(a) shall be laid before the Legislative Assembly of the State, or where there is a Legislative Council in the State, before both the Houses, and shall cease to operate at the expiration of six weeks from the reassembly of the Legislature, or if before the expiration of that period a resolution disapproving it is passed by the Legislative Assembly and agreed to by the Legislative Council, if any, upon the passing of the resolution or, as the case may be, on the resolution being agreed to by the Council; and




——————



	↑ Ins. by the State of Himachal Pradesh Act, 1970 (53 of 1970), s. 46 (w.e.f. 25-1-1971).

	↑ Subs. by the North-Eastern Areas (Reorganisation) Act, 1971 (81 of 1971) s. 71, for “ Legislature of the State of Himachal Pradesh” (w.e.f. 21-1-1972).

	↑  Ins. by the State of Mizoram Act, 1986 (34 of 1986), s. 39 (w.e.f. 20-2-1987).

	↑ Subs. by the State of Arunachal Pradesh Act, 1986 (69 of 1986), s. 42, for “Legislature of the State of Mizoram” (w.e.f. 305-1987)

	↑ Subs. by the Goa, Daman and Diu Reorganisation Act, 1987 (18 of 1987), s. 63, for “Arunachal Pradesh and Mizoram” (w.e.f. 30-5-1987).






83













[image: ]

[image: ]

Retrieved from "https://en.wikisource.org/w/index.php?title=Page:Constitution_of_India_(9_Sep_2020).pdf/83&oldid=13776717"


				
			

			
			

		
		
		  
  	
  		 
 
  		
  				Last edited on 10 January 2024, at 11:07
  		
  		 
 
  	

  
	
			
			
	    Languages

	    
	        

	        

	        This page is not available in other languages.

	    
	
	[image: Wikisource]



				 This page was last edited on 10 January 2024, at 11:07.
	Content is available under CC BY-SA 4.0 unless otherwise noted.



				Privacy policy
	About Wikisource
	Disclaimers
	Code of Conduct
	Developers
	Statistics
	Cookie statement
	Terms of Use
	Desktop



			

		
			








